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ON THE LARGEST PRIME DIVISOR OF n!+1
LI LAI

ABSTRACT. For an integer m > 1, we denote by P(m) the largest prime divisor of m. We
prove that limsup,,_, . P(n! 4+ 1)/n > 1+ 9log2 > 7.238, which improves a result of Stew-
art. More generally, for any nonzero polynomial f(X) with integer coefficients, we show that
limsup,,_, o, P(n! + f(n))/n > 1+ 9log2. This improves a result of Luca and Shparlinski.
These improvements come from an additional combinatoric idea to the works mentioned above.

1. INTRODUCTION

Let n be a positive integer, we are interested in the prime divisors of n! + 1. Does there exist
infinitely many positive integers n such that n! 4 1 is a prime number? This is of course wildly
open, so we turn our attention to find some lower bounds for the largest prime divisor of n!+ 1.

We denote by P(m) the largest prime divisor of an integer m > 1. Clearly, P(n! + 1) > n.
If p is a prime divisor of n! + 1 for an odd integer n > 3, then Wilson’s theorem implies that p
also divides (p —1 —n)!+ 1. From this, one can easily show that limsup,_, ., P(n!+1)/n > 2.

As far as I know, the first nontrivial result was obtained by Erdoés and Stewart [ES76] in
1976. They showed that limsup,,_, ., P(n! +1)/n > 2. This problem seems to be forgotten
until this century. In 2003, Luca and Shparlinski [LS05a] proved that for any polynomial f(X) €

Z[X]\ {0},

P(n! )
lim sup L () S5
n—-+o0 n 2
Later on, Stewart showed that
Pn!'+1 11
limsup LD S 1T
n—-+o0 n 2

moreover, for ¢ > 0, the set of positive integers n for which P(n!+1) > (11/2 —¢)n has positive
lower asymptotic density. Recall that for a set A of positive integers, the lower asymptotic
density of A is defined by liminf,, 1o #(AN{1,2,...,m})/m, where we use #5S to denote the
cardinality of a set S.

We also mention that in 2002, Murty and Wong [MW02] showed that if abc conjecture is true,
then

P(n!'+1) > (14 o(1))nlogn.
And in |LS05a], Luca and Shparlinski showed (unconditionally)

1
Pn!+1)>n+ <Z + 0(1)> logn,
which sharpens a result in [EST0].
In this paper, we improve the constants 5/2 and 11/2 in [LS05al [Ste04].
Theorem 1.1. Let f(X) € Z[X]\ {0}. Then
|
lim sup Plnt+ f(n)

n—+o00 n

> 1+ 9log2 ~ 7.238.
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Moreover, for any e > 0, the set of positive integers n for which n!+ f(n) > 1 and P(n!+ f(n)) >
(1+9log2 — e)n has positive lower asymptotic density.

We follow most parts of the arguments of Luca and Shparlinski [LS05a] and Stewart [Ste04].
The new ingredient in this paper is Lemma 2.7l Roughly speaking, for a prime number p and
distinct integers ny,no,...,ns < p, we are able to bound from above

log p Z min ordy(ng! + f(ng)),

ct<t’<t

for some constant ¢ > 1/2. Here ord,(m) is the p-adic order of an integer m. This upper bound
gains a multiplicative constant comparing with bounding (log p) min; <<y ord,(ng! + f(ng))
individually for each ¢ as what is done in [LS05al [Ste04].
Our new ingredient can be applied to some other related problems. For example, in [Ste04],
Stewart proved that
lim inf p(nt+1) < VIS -1

n——+oo n 8
n odd

)

where p(m) denotes the least prime divisor of an integer m > 1. By inserting our new ingredient,
the constant (/145 — 1)/8 ~ 1.380 can be improved to

/8110 2)Z + 16 — 9log 2 + 4
(log + —9log2+4 1 593,

c=

(But unlike Theorem [[T, our methods cannot prove the lower asymptotic density of the set
{n:p(n!'+1) < (c—eg)n} is positive). In [LS05b], Luca and Shparlinski showed that

P(n!+27 —1) _ 272
lim sup (! + ) > T +3.
n—+o0o n 18

The constant (272 + 3)/18 ~ 1.263 can be improved to

22 —15. 3
1+ 27— " log = =~ 1.320.
+ 6 og 5

2. PRELIMINARY LEMMAS AND NOTATIONS

Lemma 2.1. Let f(X) € Z[X]\ {0}. Then there exists a positive integer ny > 2, depending
only on f, such that the equation

k
H n+i)—fn+k)=0
does not have any integer solutions (n, k) with n > ng and k > 1

Moreover, for any integer n = ng, it holds that n!+ f(n) > 1 and f(n) # 0.

Proof. If we delete the last sentence, this is Lemma 3 of [LS05a]. But adding the last sentence
is trivial. O

Lemma 2.2. Let f(X) € Z[X]\ {0}. Then there exists a positive constant Cy depending only
on f, such that for any prime number p and any interval J C [1,p) with length |J| > 1, it holds
that

#{neN: neld p|(n+f(n)}<Col3.
Proof. See Lemma 4 of [LS05a]. O
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From now on, we fix a polynomial f(X) € Z[X] \ {0} and let ng be the constant depending
only on f in Lemma 21l We fix an ¢y € (0,1/100).

We use the Vinogradov symbols < as well as the Landau symbols O and o. Throughout this
paper, all the constants implied by < or O depend at most on f and gy (in particular, these
implied constants do not depend on z, a parameter we introduce later). It is more convenient
to specify some constants, one of them is C7: we fix a non-negative integer C7, such that

(2.1) |£(n)] < n©, for any integer n > 2.
Let A=1+9log2 — 100gy. To prove Theorem [[LT] we will show that the set
B(A) ={neN: n>nyand P(n!'+ f(n)) > A\n}

has lower asymptotic density > €.

In fact, we shall show that for all sufficiently large integers x, it holds that |[B(A\)N{1,2,...,z}| >
gox. We argue by contradiction, in the following we suppose that |[B(A) N {1,2,...,z}| < goz.
Let

xT

(2.2) Z= ][ '+ fn)).
n=[egz]
n¢B(\)

(x is large enough so that gz > ng. For n > gox, we have n! + f(n) > 1 and f(n) # 0.) By
Stirling’s formula, log(n! + f(n)) = nlogn + O(n), we have

log Z > Z (nlogn+O(n)) | —eox (zlogz + O(x)),

n=[eox|

so for sufficiently large x,

1
(2.3) log Z > <§ — 2€0> 2% log x.
We denote by |I] the length of an interval I. The following notation will be frequently used
in this paper.

Definition 2.3. Letny,na,...,n; be distinct positive integers (t = 2). We define Z(ni,na,...,ng)
to be a set of intervals as follows. Let o be the unique permutation on the index set {1,2,... t}
such that ngy(1y < ngpy < -+ < ng(y), then

Z(ny,ng,...,ny) = {I 0 I = (Ng(i), No(iv1)] for some i€ {1,2,...t— 1}}
We also define

Igood(nla no,... 7nt)
0.99

x
= {I € I(ni,na,...,ng): either [I| < or I contains at least 2C1 + 1 prime numbers} .

Note that Z(ni,na,...,n) is determined by the set {ni,na,...,n}, but Lgooq(ni,na, ..., ng)
depends on t,x and the constant Cy from (2.1]).

Notice that #Z(ni,na,...,ny) =t — 1 and the intervals in Z(nq,ne,...,n) are disjoint. It is
plainly true that
# (I(n17n27 s 7nt) \I(n17n27 cee 7”15—1)) <2

The following lemma is a variation of the key observation in [Ste04].
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Lemma 2.4. Suppose that x is larger than some constant depends at most on f and ey. Let

t, t' be integers such that 2 < t' < t. Let p be a prime number and ni,na,...,n; be distinct
positive integers in the interval [egx, min{p,x}). Then for any two distinct intervals I, I, €
Z(ni,n2,...,ny) N ZLgeed(ni,no, ..., ng) with [Io] > |I1|, we have

o £0:99
(2.4)  (logp) 1g}€i£t/{0rdp(nk! + f(nk))} < |I1|log <W> + (|Is] — | 11| + — 0O(1))log .

Proof. There exist indices i1, ji, %2, jo < t' such that I = (n;,,n;,], I> = (ni,,nj,]. we denote

D — pminlgkgt’ {ordp (ng!+f(nk))} .

From D | (ni,! + f(n;,)) and D | (nj,! + f(n;,)) we obtain that
Tle —nil

(2.5) D ‘ foi) TT iy +E) = £(ny,)
k=1
Since nj, > n;, = €ox > ng, by Lemma 2.1} we have
Mg~y

f(nn) H (nh + k) - f(njl) # 0.

k=1

Hence, we deduce from (2.5]) and (21]) that
Mgy —Miy
D<|f(ni) [T (nay+k) = fng,)| < 204100,
k=1

If |I;]| < 2999/t then log D < (299 /t + O(1)) log =, thus (2.4)) is proved. Similarly, we have

Mg —Mig
(2.6) D ‘ Fi) T (i +k) = f(ng) | #0.

k=1

If |I5| < 2999 /¢, then (Z4) is also proved.

It remains to consider the case that both |I1| and |I3| are greater than 299 /¢. By the definition
of Zeood (n1,ng,...,n), there exist distinct primes g1, qa, ..., g2c,+1 in the interval I; and there
exist distinct primes gy, ¢, . - ., @yc, 4 in the interval Io. By (2.5) and (Z8), we have

M1~y Njy —Nigy
(2.7) D ' fni)f(ng,) ] (i + %) = fna)fng) T (i, + %)
k=1 k=1
We claim that
Tj1 — My Njy —Nigy
(238) fi)fz) T (i +8) = i) f(n) [T (s +8) £0.
k=1 k=1
In fact, since Iy = (n;,,n;,] and Iy = (n4,,nj,) are disjoint, there are two cases. The first

case is that n;, < nj < ny, < ng,. If [238) does not hold, then we deduce that qyqs--- g5, 41 |
f(ni) f(nj,). Since ni,, nj,, ni,,nj, = eox > ng, we have f(n;,) f(n;,) # 0. Thus, ¢1¢5 - - - qéclﬂ <
|f(niy) f(ng,)| < 2. But gigh -+ ghe 4y = (202)?“*™, this is a contradiction because x is
large. The second case is that n;, < nj, < n;, < n;,, if (238)) does not hold, we will get a similar
contradiction from qiq2 - - - g2y 41 | f(niy) f(nj,). Hence, the claim (2.8) holds.
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Since |Iz| = nj, — ni, = |I1| = n;, — n;,, the factorial (nj, — n;,)! is a divisor of the right
hand side of (27). Since D is a power of the prime p, and n;,,n;, ,ni,, nj, < p, the factorial
(nj, —n;,)! is coprime to D. Thus, we have

(2'9) D ﬁ f(nn)f(njz) H (ni, + k) - f(nlz)f(nh) H (niz + k/)
1 11)° k=1 k'=1

Note that m! > (m/e)™ for any positive integer m and

f(nh)f(njz) H (ni, + k) - f(nlz)f(nh) H (niz + k/) < 2x201+\12\7
k=1 k'=1

we deduce from ([2.9) and (2.8]) that

[11]
D < 2xlBI-IAl+2C1 <ﬁ
L)

which completes the proof of (2.4)). O

From the proof of Lemma [2.4] we can see that, we require the intervals in Zg,50q to contain
at least 2C7 + 1 prime numbers only for the purpose to show some quantity is nonzero. The
following result of Heath-Brown will help us to show that most intervals in Z are “good” (when
t < Coa?/ 3), and this is the only non-elementary result we need in this paper.

Lemma 2.5 (Heath-Brown [Hea79]). Let 2 = p; < pa < ... denote the sequence of prime
numbers. For any e > 0, there exists a constant C. depending only on €, such that for anyy > 2
we have

23
> (k1 — i) < Coyre ™™,

PE<Y
Proof. This is Theorem 1 of [Hea79]. O
Corollary 2.6. Suppose that x is larger than some constant depends at most on f and ey. Let t
be an integer such that 2 <t < Coz?/3, where Cy is the constant in LemmalZ2. Let ny,no, ..., ny
be any distinct integers in the interval [eox, z]. Then we have
(2.10) H#L good(n1, M2, . . ., ny) =t — 2609

. . 2 2 .
Proof. Since z is large, we have t < Cpz3 < 231709 < 2. By Lemma [Z5] there exists an

absolute constant C' such that
2

(2.11) 37 (1 — pr)? < Oy 000
PESY

for any y > 2. (Recall we denote by 2 = p; < py < ... the sequence of prime numbers.)
x0.99

For any interval I € Z(ni,no,...,n¢) \ Zgood (N1, N2, . . . ,n¢), we have |I| > and I contains
at most 2C prime numbers. There are indices i, j such that I = (n;,n;]. Let py1; be the least
prime number such that pri; > nj. Then pp < n; < . On the other hand, pr11 > n; > oz,
we have k > 2C since z is large. Since I contains at most 2C; prime numbers, we must have
Pr—20, < Ni, 80 I C (Pr—20,,Pr+1)-

Let

m = #(Z(n1,n2,...,1) \ Zgood(n1,M2,...,1¢)) .
In the above paragraph, we showed that for any interval I € Z(n1,na, ..., 7:)\Zgood (N1, N2, - . ., 10¢),
there exists a prime number p, < x (with k& > 2C4) such that I C (pg—2c,,Pk+1). Now, for
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any index k such that k& > 2C; and pr < z, we denote by my the number of intervals in
Z(ni,n2,...,n¢) \ Zgood(n1,n2,...,ny) that are contained in (py—ac,,pr+1). Then

Z mg = m

PL ST
k>2C
and

0.99\ 2
X
> (pr41 —pr—2cy)? = Y mp ( >

Pl ST Pl ST t
k>2C k>2Cq
$1.98
= t—2 mg
PE<T
k>2C
1.98
T
(2.12) >m-

On the other hand, by (2.I1]) and the Cauchy-Schwarz inequality, we have

> (P —pracy)’

PR <T
k>20

P <x
k>20

<2C1 +1)* ) (per1 — pr)?

PE<T

<(2C1 +1) Z ((Prs1 — Pe)* + Pk — Pr—1)" + -+ + (Pr—20141 — Pr—201)°)

(2.13) <20 +1)2-C- s t0001 o o Tg+0.01, (Because x is large.)

Combining (2.12)) and (ZI3]) we obtain that

12 t

m < — < < 099,

218003~ .95—0.04
2
(We used t < 23700 and ¢ < z.) Therefore,

#Igood(nl , N2, .

cong) =t —1—m>t— 2t
The proof of Corollary is complete.

O
The following lemma is the key step of this paper.

Lemma 2.7. Suppose that x is larger than some constant depends at most on f and 9. Let p
be a prime number. Let t be an integer such that

100
<9> <t < Coas,
€0

where Cy is the constant in Lemmal[2.2. Let J be an interval such that

J C [eoz, min{z, p}).

.,n¢ are distinct integers in the interval J, then we have
t

If ni,ng, ..

(2.14)

i |J] zlogx
logp > min {ordy (! + f(n))} < 75 logt +

()1
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Proof. Let t; = #Zg00d(n1,M2, - .., n¢). Plainly, t; <t — 1. By Corollary 2.6] we have
(2.15) t >t — 26999,
We list the lengths of all intervals in Zyo0q (n1,ng,...,n¢) in ascending order:
(2.16) MSPR2S S
Since n1,n2,...,n; € J, and the intervals in Zgooq(n1,n2,. .., 1) are disjoint, it holds that
t1
(217) S <l
k=1
Let
(2.18) ty = [t — 3t%9].
Then from (t; — ta + 1)y, < 34—y, W < |J| and @ZIB)@I8) we deduce that
I
(2'19) 7t2 =X to 99 °
For any ¢’ < t, from the definition of Z(ny, ng, . ..,ny) (see Definition 23]) we immediately see
that

# (I(Tll,TlQ, o 7nt’) \I(n17n27 o 7nt’—1)) <2
Let k be an integer in the range

(2.20) 0<k<ts, tyg= E (t— 5t0'99)J ,
then we have
(2.21) # (I(ni,n2, ..., ne—k) N ZLgood (N1, M2, ..., 1)) =t — 2k,
In particular, for k in the range (2.20]), we have (recall (Z.15]))

#(Z(n1,m2, ... ;) N Zgood (N1, N2, ..., 1)) = 3¢0-99,
Let I}k), IQ(k), . ,IFQQQHI be the shortest [t°99]+1 intervals in Z(n1, na, . . ., ny—g) Zgood (11, 12, . . .
such that

I <121 <o < oo |

Then, by (Z2I]) and (ZI6]) we obtain that
(2.22) II®)| < o, for i = 1,2, [1999] 4+ 1.
In particular, taking (2.20) and (2.19)) into consideration, we have
(2.23) |I[t0 gng| Y, < t’o.iglg‘

Let k be in the range (Z.20). By Lemma[24] for any i € {1,2,..., [t"9]}, we have

0.99

(224) logp min ford,(n;+(n;)} < |1/ |log (uedfn) (L =111+ == +0(1) log a.
\J\ .

Taking the average of (Z24)) over i € {1,2,...,[t"?]}, and notice that the function y

ylog(ex/y) is increasing on y € (0,z), it follows that

ex |I[t0 00711 209

(k) + £0.99 t
| [£0-997 |

logp min_ {ordy(n;!+ (1))} < ;00| log +0(1) | loga,

1<j<

7nt)
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then, bounding |]Ffo)991| by ([2.22)) and bounding |If,0.09741] by (Z:23), we obtain that
(2.25)

1 in {ord,(n;!+ f(n;))} < log | —= | + ﬂJrﬂJrO(l) 1
ng1<1]n<1?—k ordy(ng ! U S V2k+[t0-99] 10g Yoty ] 4198 r og .

Summing (2:25]) over k in the range (2.20]), we obtain
t3

logp ) min {fordy(ng! + f(n;))}
k=0

<<tk

t3
ex J
< (Z Yok +[10-997 108 (7)) + <t’0~—9’8 + 2099 4 O(t)) log x
k=0

Y2k+[10-997

t3
ex zlog x
(2.26) < (Z Vor[10-997 10g ( >> + t0-§8 + O(x),

o Y2k+[10-997

where in the last inequality we used |J| < 2 and ¢ < Coxs.
Finally, since the function y — ylog(ex/y) is concave and increasing on y € (0, z), and since

t3 t3
1
Z%kﬂta%] < B} Z (72k+(t0~991 + 72k+(t0~991+1)
k=0 k=0
1 &
<32
k=1
bl
~ 2 )

we have (by the Jensen’s inequality and the monotonicity)

t3

1 N 1 |J1/2 1 ex
kzzoﬁkﬂtasg] og <72k+“0991> <(ts+1)- St 1 og <(|J|/2)/(t3 - 1)>
< ﬂlog( cat ) = Mlogt—kﬂlog< er )
2 J1/2 2 2 1J]/2
(2.27) < 171 logt + x,

2
where in the last inequality we used |J|/2 < z and the the function y — ylog(ex/y) is increasing
ony € (0,x).
By (220), 227), and the fact ¢t — t3 < ((H%) t] (recall t3 = L% (t—5t%9) | and t >
(10/£0)'9), we complete the proof of (Z.14)). O

3. PROOF OoF THEOREM [[L1]

Recall the definition of B(\) and Z (see (2:2))), we know that P(Z) < A\x.
For a prime number p, we denote

N, ={neN: ne€lezx,z],n ¢ B(\), and p | (n! + f(n))}.
Then,

(3.1) (logp) ord,(Z) = logp Z ordy(n! + f(n)).
neNp
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If n > pandp| (n!'+ f(n)), then f(n) =0 (mod p). Let a # 0 be the leading coefficient
of f(X). If p > l|a|, then f(X) (mod p) has degree deg f. Hence, for any two real numbers
y2 > y1 = p, we have #(Np N [y1,v2]) < ((y2 —y1)/p + 1) deg f. That is,

(3.2) #(Np N [y1,y2]) < % +1, for any yo > vy1 = p.

If p < |al, then #(Np, N [y1,y2]) <y2 —y1 +1 < |a|(y2 —y1)/p + 1, so B:2) also holds.

Recall that |f(n)] < n® for all n > 2. Since f(n) # 0 for n > ng, we have ord,(f(n)) <
Cylogn/logp. We can take a large constant Cy > ny depending only on Cy and ng (so Cy
depends only on f), such that for any prime p and any integer n > Csp, it holds that n/p —1 >
Cilogn/logp. Since ordy,(n!) > n/p—1, we deduce that for any prime p and any n > Cop(> ny),
we have ord,(n! + f(n)) = ord,(f(n)) = O(logn/logp). Therefore, for any prime p,

(3.3) log p Z ordy(n! + f(n)) < (% + 1> logr < zlogx.

n€Np
n=2Cop

By @B2)), we have [N, N [p, Cop)| = O(1). Since log(n! + f(n)) = O(zlogx) for ng < n < =,

we have

(3.4) log p Z ord,(n!+ f(n)) < 1-zlogz < zlogx.
pén<lip
For any n € N, N [1,p), by the definition of B(\), we have p < An. We denote the interval
(3.5) Jp = [max{p/\, eox}, min{p,z}).
Then,

N,N[1,p) C J,.
We claim that
(3.6) logp Z ordy(n! + f(n))

n€Np
n<p

1
< Jy|log? z 4+ O(zlog ).
910g(2/(1+50))| pllog”z + Ofzlogz)

In fact, if N, N [1,p) = 0, then there is nothing to prove. In the following, we assume that
T:=#(Np,N[l,p)) >1and
N,N[L,p) ={ni,ng,...,nr}.
Relabeling if necessary, we can assume that
(3.7) ordy(ni! + f(n1)) = ordy(ng! + f(n2)) = -+ = ordy(ny! + f(nr)).
If |Jp| > 1, then Lemma 2.2 implies that 7" < C'0|Jp|§ < Cozs. If |Jp] <1, then T'< 1< Cozs.
So it is always true that
(3.8) T < Cozs.

Let £* be the least non-negative integer such that
k* 100
1
(52) < ()
2 €0

k
1
Tk:< zg()) T, k=01,... k.

and we denote

Note that
logT

(3.9) k" = log(2/(1 + &0))

+0(1).
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For any 0 < k < k*, by Lemma 27 (with ¢t = [T} ] and J = J,) and [B.7), we have

[T ]
(3.10) log p Z ordy(n;! + f(n;)) < J7p| log T}, +
i=|Tky1]+1

xlogx

Since log(n!+ f(n)) = O(zlog z) for ng < n < x and T+ = O(1), we have

| T |
(3.11) log p Z ord,(n;! + f(n;)) = O(xzlog z).
i=1
Summing B.I0) over £ =0,1,...,k* — 1 and (3.11]), we obtain that
T ) k-1 ol
_ b "
(3.12) logp;ordp(m!—i-f(ni)) = kZ:O log Ty, +x log = kZ:;) W+O(mlogm)+0(l€ x).

We estimate each term in the right hand side of (3.12]) as follows. Since

k*—1 k*—1
2 (k* — Dk* 2
> logTp =Y (logT —klog (—— ) ) = k" log T — 1

k=0

log? T + O(logT) (by (33))

log? z + O(logz), (by B3))

we have
k*—1

|Jp] 1 ,
log Tj, < | -

Since T}, decreases exponentially, we have
k*—1

1 1
< <1
kZ:O (T3 ]098 ™ [Tjr_1 098

By B.9) and (3.3),
E*x = O(zlogx).

Hence, plugging these estimates above into ([3.12]), we deduce that

| T, log? z 4+ O(x log ),

T
log p Z ordy(n;! + f(n;))

1
- S Tlog(2/(1 + 20))

this is exactly ([B.6) we claimed.
Combining (310), (33), (34) and (B.6]), we have

1
(3.13) (log p) ordy(Z) < 9log(2/(1 4+ 0))

which holds for any prime number p. Since P(Z) < Az and |J,| < min{p,z} — p/\, summing
(BI3) over primes p < Az we obtain that

|| log? z 4+ O(x log x),

log Z < da=1/Np+ Y (z—p/N) | log’z+ O(a?),

p<T r<p<AT

9log(2/(1 + ¢))
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where for the error term we used m(Az) < x/log . By the fact 7(y) = (1 + o(1))y/logy and

1 2
Zp=<§+0(l)> 4 as y — +00,

Py log Y

we deduce that

1 A—1
14 log Z < 1)) 21 :
(3.14) og (910g(2/(1—|—60)) 5 + o( )>x ogx, asxT — 400
By comparing (2.3]) with (3.I4]), we have
1 A—1 1

>__2 3
9log(2/(1 +20)) 2 ~ 2 =0

which implies that

2
A>1+9(1—4ep)l ,
ot e (122

but this contradicts A =1+ 9log 2 — 100¢gg.
Hence, the above contradiction shows that the lower asymptotic density of B(A) must be
greater than or equal to €. The proof of Theorem [I.1]is complete.
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